
# 1 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 1

$50 $250 $200

ITEM Sam Tell & Son Central Poly Pyramid School Hill & Markes
Interboro 
Packaging Buck Supply

All American 
Poly

Multifold Paper 
Towels 14.99

per case 12/334
item # 01920
Roll Toilet Tissue 28.45
sheets per roll
per case 96
item # GL-965002

Large Plastic Trash 
Bags 26.61

33x40  100# dry/75 # 
wet
per case 500

item # DRHD3340H

Large Plastic Trash 
Bags 17.61
40x63
per case 150

item # CRHD3860H

Medium Plastic 
Trash Bags 22.35
20 - 30 gallon
per case 500

item # CRHD3037H

Small Plastic Trash 
Bags 10.80

24x24 20# dry / 10# 
wet
per case 1,000

item # CP2424N
5oz Cold Cups 25.90

per case 2,500
item # DC-5N25
8oz Hot/Cold Cups 14.90
23x10x39
per case 1,000
item # DC-8J8

Silicone Free 
Furniture Polish 46.87



# 1 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 2

ITEM Sam Tell & Son Central Poly Pyramid School Hill & Markes
Interboro 
Packaging Buck Supply

All American 
Poly

per case 12
item # LG-AMRA13320

Aerosol Furniture 
Polish 27.98

20 oz
per case 12
item # 433-4109
Liquid Disinfectant / 
Cleaner (non-
abrasive) Comet 40.75

32 oz
per case 8
item # PNG 84959183

Roll Paper Towel - 
White 18.00

85
per case 30
item # CAS4073A1

Roll Paper Towel - 
Brown 37.50

250 sht
per case 12
item # 28290

Brawny Paper 
Towel 46.60

Bounty
per case 30
item # LG-PGC28838

Spray Disinfectant 24.35
20 oz

per case 12
item # 433-4104

Liquid All Purpose 
Bathroom Cleaner 15.45

gal
per case 4
item # SMZF1235004

Multipurpose 
Germicidal Cleaner 15.20

gal
per case 4
item # SMZQ3006004

Bleach 13.50
96oz

per case 6
item # CLX02460



# 1 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 3

ITEM Sam Tell & Son Central Poly Pyramid School Hill & Markes
Interboro 
Packaging Buck Supply

All American 
Poly

Oxiclean 10.48
25lb 1
per case 15#
item # LG-CDC 51781

Brooms 3.92

per case EA
item # E502018

Liquid Bowl 
Cleaner 14.00

32oz
per case 12
item # SMZ02012
Air Deodorizer 19.00

qt
per case 12
item # SMZL2107012

8oz Mop Head 22.97

per case 12
item # GS-AWM7512

16oz Mop Head 26.79

per case 12
item # GS-AWM7516

20oz Mop Head 30.15

per case 12
item # GS-AWM7520

Murphy's Oil 57.95
gal

per case 6
item # CLCPL01103

Bully creme cleanser -
qt 18.30

qt
per case 12
item # SMZG1325012

Digest 23.50
gal

per case 4
item # SMZD0860004

Ammonia 11.27

per case 6
item # CR-AMMONIA

Powder Cleaner 30.65



# 1 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 4

ITEM Sam Tell & Son Central Poly Pyramid School Hill & Markes
Interboro 
Packaging Buck Supply

All American 
Poly

21oz Comet
per case 24
item # PNG84838569

32oz Spray Bottles .38

per case

item #
BSD-

320ZSPRAYP

Trigger Sprayers .35

per case
item # CON902BW9
17" Black Stripping 
Pad for Buffing 
Machine 9.25

per case 5
item # Glit 20011

17" Blue Scrubbing 
Pad 9.25

per case 5
item # Glit 20206

17" White Buffing / 
Polishing Pad 9.25

per case 5
item # Glit 14417

19" Black Stripping 
Pad 10.99

per case 5
item # Glit 20013

19" Blue Cleaner 
Pad 10.99

per case 5
item # Glit 29774

19" White Polishing 
Pad 10.99

per case 5
item # Glit 20480

19" Blue Scrubbing 
Pad - High Speed 10.99

per case 5



# 1 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 5

ITEM Sam Tell & Son Central Poly Pyramid School Hill & Markes
Interboro 
Packaging Buck Supply

All American 
Poly

item # Glit 29774
19" White Buffing / 
Polishing Pad - High 
Speed 16.99

per case 5
item # Glit 20480

19" Red Buffing 
Pad 10.99

per case 5
item # Glit 20052

Oil Based Stainless 
Steel Cleaner 21.75

18 oz
per case 12

item # CLRCS234

Stainless Steel 
Cleaner 21.75

18 oz
per case 12
item # CLRCS234
Sm Vinyl Gloves 25.50

per case 10/100

item # ISL102202
Med Vinyl Gloves 25.50

per case 10/100

item # ISL102204
Lrg Vinyl Gloves 25.50

per case 10/100

item # ISL102206
X Lrg Vinyl Gloves 25.50

per case 10/100

item # ISL102208

Small Powder-Free 
Latex Exam Gloves 56.00

per case 10/100



# 1 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 6

ITEM Sam Tell & Son Central Poly Pyramid School Hill & Markes
Interboro 
Packaging Buck Supply

All American 
Poly

item #
MedPride-sm-

LPFG-E

Med Powder-Free 
Latex Exam Gloves 56.00

per case 10/100

item #
MedPride-med-

LPFG-E

Lrg Powder-Free 
Latex Exam Gloves 56.00

per case 10/100

item #
MedPride-lrg-

LPFG-E

X-Lrg Powder-Free 
Latex Exam Gloves 56.00

per case 10/100

item #
MedPride-X-lrg-

LPFG-E

Sm Powder-Free 
Nitrile Exam Gloves 45.98

per case 10/100

item #
Microflex-sm-

NPFG-E

Med Powder-Free 
Nitrile Exam Gloves 50.90

per case 10

item # SA-GNPR-MD

Lrg Powder-Free 
Nitrile Exam Gloves 50.90

per case 10

item # SA-GNPR-LG

X-Lrg Powder-Free 
Nitrile Exam Gloves 50.90

per case 10

item # SA-GNPR-XL
Mop Handles 59.88 7.39

per case 12 1
item # ABCO 01204NB GS-HWM1516-F



# 1 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 7

ITEM Sam Tell & Son Central Poly Pyramid School Hill & Markes
Interboro 
Packaging Buck Supply

All American 
Poly

Floor Wax 37.50

per case 5 gal
item # SMZCS0740005

Floor Stripper 24.50

per case 5 gal
item # SMZR3025005

Floor Finish 34.00

per case 5 gal
item # SMZCS0750005  
Liquid Soap 23.25

gal
per case 4
item # SMZCS0215004

Laundry Detergent 21.25
Simoniz

per case 50#
item # SMZC0597050

Dish Detergent 15.30
gal

per case 4
item # SMZP2705004

Cleaner / Degreaser 14.75
Simonize AP7 gal
per case 4
item # SMZP2666004

Cleaner / Degreaser 16.65

Simonize Strike 
Force qt
per case 12
item # SMZC0595012

GOJO Liquid Hand 
Soap 39.41

2L -2217
per case 4
item # GOJ 221704
Liquid Hand Soap 17.00

gal
per case 4

item # SMZCS025004

Hand Sanitizers 45.00
Purell 9656/9657 800ml
per case 6
item # GJ965606



# 1 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 8

ITEM Sam Tell & Son Central Poly Pyramid School Hill & Markes
Interboro 
Packaging Buck Supply

All American 
Poly

Hand Sanitizers 
Foam 50.00
5392 1.2 ltr
per case 2
item # GJ539202

Single Use Laundry 
Det 30.00

2 oz
per case 100
item # DIV74061

Prolux Vacuum 
Bags

Mighty Mite Type 
MM Vacuum Bags

Sanitaire Vacuum 
Bags - UP 1 - 9100, 
C4900

Sanitaire Vacuum 
Bags - SD - P1/6600

Vacuum Cleaner 
Scent Tabs - Style 
515

Ecolab TriStar 
Flexylight 115.32
#16326
per case 5 gal
item # ECO16326

Ecolab Neutral 
Floor Cleaner 44.65
#21013 2 liter
per case 2
item # ECO21013
Ecolab Heavy Duty 
Bathroom Cleaner 
Disinfectant 67.47
#10158 2 liter
per case 2
item # ECO10158

Ecolab Orange 
Force 67.20
# 21038 2 liter
per case 2
item # ECO21038

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



# 1 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 9

ITEM Sam Tell & Son Central Poly Pyramid School Hill & Markes
Interboro 
Packaging Buck Supply

All American 
Poly

Ecolab Revitalize 
Perfusion Carpet 
Cleaner 76.38
# 10379 2-3 weeks
per case 10# 
item # ECO10379

Ecolab Solid Surge 
Plus 158.39
# 17905 9# 
per case 4
item # ECO17905

Ecolab All Purpose 
Cleaner 115.80
# 14205
per case 2 - 2 liter
item # ECO14205

Ecolab Solid 
Navisoft 98.12
# 16001 6#
per case 2
item # ECO16001
Ecolab Stain Away 75.99
# 13649 4#
per case 2
item # ECO13649
Cleaning Rags

Glass Cleaner 14.00
qt

per case 12
item # SMZ08012

Antibacterial Foam 
Soap w/Dispenser 39.00  
(dispenser) 1250ml
per case 3
item # GJE5162EXL

MPC Flashback SB 
Spray Buff or Equal 77.00

gal
per case 4
item # JNJ4116
MPC All-Surf All 
Purpose Cleaner or 
Equal 15.75

gal
per case 4
item # SMZB0320004

NO BID



# 1 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 10

ITEM Sam Tell & Son Central Poly Pyramid School Hill & Markes
Interboro 
Packaging Buck Supply

All American 
Poly

Simonize Freedom 
Bowl Cleaner - 4 gal 
or equal 17.00

gal
per case 4
item # SMZP1235004

Magic Erasers (Mr. 
Clean) or equal 22.85

per case 6/4/cs
item # PNG84964667

Orange Glo or equal

Enmotion Towels 42.75
White 800'
per case 6
item # GPF89460
Enmotion Towels 40.59
Brown 800'
per case 6
item # GPF89480
Toilet Cleaner 75.22
# ECO21029
per case 2 - 2 liter
item # ECO21029

Oasis 63 - 
disinfectant 67.69
# ECO14206
per case 2 - 2 liter
item # ECO14206

Oasis 41 - glass 
cleaner 44.70
# ECO24156
per case 2 - 2 liter
item # ECO24156
Oasis Pro 16 67.20
# ECO21038
per case 2 - 2 liter
item # ECO21038

MINIMUM 
ORDER         TO 

AVOID    
$50 $250 $200

NO BID



# 2 NUTRITION SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 1

$200 $250

ITEM Interboro All American Poly Central Poly Buck Supply Hill & Markes
Aluminum Foil 14.85

per case
item # WES294
Apron Plastic 32.88

per case 10/100
item # SA-DAP1.25
Bags: 10# Elephant 34.95

per case 1,000
item # DUO80042
Bags: 10# Brown 11.04

per case 500

item # BSD-10LB-REG
Bags: 6# White - waxed 44.00

per case 1,000
item # PPC300296
Bags: 6# White 11.63

per case 500

item # BSD-6LB-WHITE
Bags: 6# Brown 35.00

per case 4/500

item # DUO80010

Garbage Bags: 6.98 / 6.24 / 5.32 26.17
23x10x39
per case 250 500

item #
INT-3340-Hvy / H 

/ Heavy HR334013N
Poly Bags 10.24 / 9.82 16.45
6x3x15
per case 1,000 1,000

item #
INT-6315-Hvy / 
INT-1015-Heavy FOR110NP

Poly Bags 8.98 14.08 21.50
10x18x24
per case 250 350 500



# 2 NUTRITION SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 2

item # INT-1824-H AAP1618 CP101824
Sandwich Bags: #130 wax 64.00

per case 6/1,000

item # PPC300404
Sandwich Bags: plastic 10.72 11.91

per case 2,000 2,000

item # Sterling-675675 EL-DP5555
Banquet Paper 15.95

per case 40x300
item # HOF260045
5 oz Bowls 12.47

per case 1,000
item # DC-5BWWC
12 oz Bowls 13.11

per case 1,000
item # DC-12BWWC
Cup - Foam - squat - 4 oz 16.10

per case 1,000
item # DRT4J6
Lid for above 9.10

per case 1,000
item # DC-6JL DRT6JL
Cup - Foam - squat - 8 oz 27.27

per case 1,000
item # DC-8SJ20
Lid for above 13.73

per case 1,000
item # DC-20JL
Cup: Hot/Cold, 8 oz 14.84
DC8J
per case 1,000
item # DC-8J8
Lid for above: Hot/Cold, 8 oz 8.82

per case 1,000
item # DC-8JL



# 2 NUTRITION SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 3

Deli Container - clear w/lid - 
12 oz - rectangular 23.50

per case 200
item # GENAD12

Dinex 8 oz disposible lids for 8 
oz Turnbury mugs 34.00

per case 1,000
item # DIN30008775
Film - 18" x 500' 11.55

per case
item # WES182
Gloves - latex - medium - for 
food handling 32.30
for food handling
per case 1,000

item # H4BE

Gloves - latex - large - for food 
handling 33.22
for food handling
per case 1,000

item # H4BE

Gloves - plastic - for food 
handling 31.45
for food handling
per case 1,000

item # H4BE
Hair Nets 53.00

per case 1,000

item # HN24B
Napkins - 1 ply 23.75

per case 6,000
item # MOR1250MS
Plates - paper - 6" 8.50

per case 1,000
item # WIN6100
Plates - styrofoam - 9" 12.05



# 2 NUTRITION SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 4

per case 500
item # GEN80900

Plates - styrofoam - 10.25" 21.85

per case 500
item # GEN81000
Sacks 1/6 29.90

per case 500
item # BSD-1/6 57

Tray - aluminum - 3 
compartment HDM 34.10

per case 250
item # PP73930CP
Powder Cleanser - qt 18.35

21 oz
per case 24
item # CAL752088
All-Purpose Liquid Cleaner - 
gal 15.00

per case 4 gal
item # SMZB032004
Bleach - gal 10.29

per case 6

item # CR-BLEACH-6
Cream Cleanser - qt 18.20

per case 12
item # SMZG1325012
Excaliber Sanitizer

Flash Dri (5 gal pail) 38.50

per case 5 gal
item # SMZC0710005
Liquid Laundry Soap 17.20

per case 4 gal
item # SMZW420004
White Paper Towel 17.70
2 ply / 85 sht 85
per case 30
item # SOFKTGREEN

NO BID



# 2 NUTRITION SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 5

Reusable 3 comp tray  209.00

per case 600
item # OLV51451
Scotch Brite Pads 13.85

per case 60
item # GLT96A
Wypalls x 60 53.09
2 ply / 85 sht
per case 1260
item # LG-KCC34790
Blue Tough Towel 58.00
13 x 24
per case 150
item # CHX03120011
Brown Paper Towels 49.37

per case 12
item # GP-92001
Paper Place Mats (white) 15.75

per case 1,000
item # SNF150
Paper Place Mats (green) 15.75

per case 1,000
item # SNF6025
Paper Place Mats (red) 15.75

per case 1,000
item # SNF6005
Heavy Duty Floor Cleaner  
(liquid) 15.75

gal
per case 4
item # SMZB0320004
Speedball Cleaner 16.65

qt
per case 12
item # SMZC0595012
Dishwasher Detergent 43.00
Cascade or Equivalent 85 oz
per case 6
item # PNG84959168
Oasis 115 xp 61.70

per case 2.5 gal



# 2 NUTRITION SUPPLIES AWARD
January 1, 2012 - June 30, 2012

12/22/2011 dt 6

item # ECO10625
Oasis 100 72.00

per case 2.5 gal
item # ECO14522

Liquid Dish Detergent 38.63

per case 5 gal

item # ECO11262
ECOLAB Solid Power 82.30

per case 4/9 lb
item # ECO6100185

MINIMUM ORDER TO 
AVOID               SHIPPING 

FEES
$200 $250
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